
SBI INFRA MANAGEMENT SOLUTIONS PVT.LTD.

CIRCLE OFFICE, THIRD FLOOR, STATE BANK OF INDIA, SYNERGY BUILDING, C-6, G-BLOCK, 
BANDRA KURLA COMPLEX, BANDRA EAST, MUMBAI-400051

PART – B :  FINANCIAL BID

TENDER FOR :

TENDER ID MUM202007004                                                                       DATE : 02.07.2020

PROPOSED FURNITURE  WORK FOR TREASURY AKOLA BRANCH

TENDER   SUBMITTED BY     :

NAME : __________________________________

ADDRESS : __________________________________

__________________________________

__________________________________

DATE : __________________________________

TENDER INVITED BY:
Vice President & Circle Head,
SBI Infra Management Solutions Pvt. Ltd; 3rd floor, Circle Office, State Bank of India, Synergy 
building, C-6, G Block,
Bandra -Kurla complex, Bandra East, Mumbai-400051.

ARCHITECT :
S. NANDEDKAR & ASSOCIATES
ARCHITECT, INTERIOR, FURNITURE & CIVIL DESIGNER
103, `UTKARSHA UMANG’, BESIDE MT. CARMEL SCHOOL, AJNI SQUARE, NAGPUR – 440015
Tel : 0712 2252945, Fax-0712 2243921, 
MOB : +91 9823294893, 9823040281, E-mail:- officesna@gmail.com

mailto:officesna@gmail.com


S.NO. PARTICULARS UNIT QTY. RATE AMOUNT

S.NO. PARTICULARS UNIT QTY. RATE AMOUNT
1 Providing & fixing in position  table for Branch Manager 

(size-  1800X750X750mm) to be made out of 18/19 mm 
thk. IS:303 Grade BWR Plywood finished with approved 
4mm thk. high end TW Vineer with polycoat polish at top, 
and 4mm thk TW Vineer with melamine polish for all other 
exposed  surfaces.  The  top  of  the  table  to  have  TW 
moulding  all  around.  The  rate  shall  be  inclusive  of 
providing a keyboard tray on sliding telescopic channels & 
a pedestal  drawer unit  made out  of 16mm thk.  IS:  303 
grade BWR Plywood on side with 02 nos. of equal sized 
drawers  on  sliding channels  & openable  shutter  below. 
The side credenza shall be on other side and shall be paid 
for seperately under the relevant item. All internal surfaces 
to  be finished in  approve  0.80mm thk  laminate.  All  the 
external surfaces shall be finished with 4mm thk approved 
high end TW Vineer with melamine polish including the 
pedestal drawer unit. The table shall have 12mm thk clear 
glass  on top with  bevelled edges & necessary holes & 
provision of 12mm glass at front side for modesty panel. 
The rate also include PU trolley of reputed manufacturer, 
keyboard tray as per approved make which shall be heavy 
duty. The necessary hardware such as automatic locking, 
ball  catches, wire managers, etc. to be provided as per 
the  instructions  of  the  SBI-INFRA/BANK/Architect.  The 
Elevation of the table shall be as direced by the Engineer 
on site. Design & detail  of the table shall be as per the 
Bank's  new  uniform  colour,  layout  &  elevation  policy 
available with Bank's Engineer.

Nos. 1   

2 Officer  &  Staff  Tables:  Providing  &  fixing  in  position 
tables  made of  18/19mm MR grade  ply  at  top,  side  & 
front, support along with drawer unit & keyboard tray with 
telescopic arrangement & CPU base resting on footrest of 
TW  member-75X40mm,  including  19mm MR grade  ply 
Modesty panel.  All  external surfaces to be finished with 
1mm  thk  Laminate  &  internal  surfaces  finished  with 
0.80mm laminate of  approved shade & make, including 
powder coated fittings like sliding channel for keyboard & 
drawers, medium duty hinges for shutter, cable manager, 
S.S.handles  in  approved  design  &  size  and  locks 
wherever directed in approved make. All exposed plywood 
edges to be finished with 6mm thk. TW Beading having 03 
coats of French polish in appoved shade and necessary 
locks to shutters etc. complete in all respects. Design & 
detail of the table shall be as per the Bank's new uniform 
colour,  layout  &  elevation  policy  available  with  Bank's 
Engineer.

    

a 1500 x 750 x 760 mm ( Officer Table) Nos. 2   
c 1200 x 750 x 760 mm-Assistant/Clerical Tables Nos. 3   
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S.NO. PARTICULARS UNIT QTY. RATE AMOUNT

3 Providing and Supplying Grahak Mitra/Tech Mitra table 
of size 1350 x 675 x 750 mm made of 18 mm MR grade 
ply at top, side & front, support along with drawer unit & 
Keyboard tray with telescopic arrangement & CPU base 
rsting on footrest. 18mm MR grade ply Modesty panel with 
fixing blue glass. All external surfaces to be finished with 
1mm thk. Laminate & internal surfaces with 0.80mm thk 
Laminate of  approved shade & make, including powder 
coated  fitings  like  sliding  channels,  for  keyboard  & 
drawers, medium duty hinges for shutter, cable manager. 
S.S  Handles  in  approved  design  &  size  and  locks 
wherever directed in approved make. All exposed plywood 
edges to be finished with 6mm thk. TW Beading having 03 
coats of French polish in appoved shade and necessary 
locks to shutters etc. complete in all respects.

Nos. 1   

4 Same as above size but without front blue glass - System 
Room table(two computers)-size - 910X600X760mm

Rmt 1   

5 Providing & fixing side table of 910 x 400 x 760 mm size 
for Officer & Assistant, made of 18 mm thick ply for all top, 
support and side with 6 mm thick ply at back externally 
finished with 1.0 mm thick laminate and internal surface 
shall  be  finished  with  0.8  mm  thk.  laminate,  both  of 
approved  make  including  brush  finish  SS  handles, 
shutters  hinges  with  necessary  teak  wood  beading 
including  three  coats  of  French  polish  to  teak  wood 
member and necessary locks to drawer/ shutters etc. all 
required surface.   

Nos. 6   

6 Providing & fixing side table of 1050 x 450 x 760 mm size 
for  Br.  Manager,  made of  18 mm thick  ply  for  all  top, 
support and side with 6 mm thick ply at back externally 
finished with  4.0  mm thick vineer laminate and  internal 
surface shall be finished with 0.8 mm thk. laminate, both 
of  approved  make  including  brush  finish  SS  handles, 
shutters  hinges  with  necessary  teak  wood  beading 
including  three  coats  of  French  polish  to  teak  wood 
member and necessary locks to drawer/ shutters etc. all 
required surface.   

Nos. 1   

7 Providing & Fixing Writing desk as per drawing out of 18 
mm thick comm. ply and 1.0mm thick laminate on external 
& internal surfaces, T.W. beading to all edges of ply with 
three  coats  of  French  polish  &  8  mm  thk.  Glass  for 
separation of slips with polished edges etc. complete.

Nos. 1   

8 Providing & fixing  Lockable Notice Boards  900 x 750 
mm size x 50mm deep, made up of 12 mm soft board fully 
covered by approved colour upholstery & fixed on 12 mm 
commercial ply backing & with sliding shutters out of 5mm 
thk.  Clear  glass  with  locking  arrangement  and  running 
within required size T.W beading including three coats of 
French  polish  of  approved  shade  to  T.W. beading  and 
necessary hinges, fixtures & fastenings etc. complete.

Nos. 2   
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9 Providing and fixing 425mm deep File Storage Cabinets 
out of 18 mm thick commercial ply with T.W. beading on 
edges, 6 mm thick commercial ply on back with one coat 
of wooden primer, 1 mm thick laminate (multi colour and 
grooves  in  laminate  as  per  drawing)  on  all  external 
surfaces & 0.8 mm thk. laminate on all internal surfaces, 
4”  long  brush  finished  stainless  steel  handles,  locks, 
magnets for shutters and three coats of French polish to 
T.W. beading/ T.W. members as per drawing.

Sqm 18   

10 Providing and fixing 425mm deep File Storage Cabinets 
For BR. Manager out of 18 mm thick commercial ply with 
T.W. beading on edges,  6 mm thick commercial  ply on 
back with one coat of wooden primer, 4 mm thick vineer 
(multi colour and grooves in vineer as per drawing) on all 
external surfaces & 0.8 mm thk. laminate on all internal 
surfaces, 4” long brush finished stainless steel  handles, 
locks,  magnets  for  shutters  and  three  coats  of  French 
polish to T.W. beading/ T.W. members as per drawing.

Sqm 3   

10 Providing  &  fixing  68mm  thick  full  ht.  Full  ht. 
Dead/Partially  Glazed  partition with  6mm  thick  MR 
grade Comm. ply to either side of frame of 50 mm x 50 
mm x 1mm Aluminium sections at  610 mm c/c  in  both 
direction with  1.0 mm thick laminate (in multi  colour)  of 
approved shade and make on both side including partially 
glazed  door  shutter  out  of  BWR solid  core  flush  door 
panel, fixing 8 mm thick glass with etching, S.S. handles, 
Mortised lock, door closer (OZONE make), door stopper 
and three coats of French polish of approved shade to TW 
beading as per drawing. The item also includes grouting 
frame in wall/  floor & ceiling etc. complete. (Al. sections 
shall  carry  up to  slab soffit.  Measurement  up to  ceiling 
only will be paid.)

Sq.m 8   

11 Providing  &  fixing  68mm  thick  full  ht.  Full  ht. 
Dead/Partially  Glazed  partition with  6mm  thick  MR 
grade Comm. ply to either side of frame of 50 mm x 50 
mm x 1mm Aluminium sections at  610 mm c/c  in  both 
direction with  1.0 mm thick laminate (in multi  colour)  of 
approved shade and make on one side & 4mm thick high 
end  T.W.Vineer of approved shade and make on other 
side including partially  glazed  door shutter  out  of  BWR 
solid core flush door panel, fixing 8 mm thick glass with 
etching, S.S. handles, Mortised lock, door closer (OZONE 
make), door stopper and three coats of French polish of 
approved shade to TW beading as per drawing. The item 
also includes grouting frame in wall/  floor & ceiling etc. 
complete.  (Al.  sections  shall  carry  up  to  slab  soffit. 
Measurement up to ceiling only will be paid.)

Sq.m 20   

12 ACP  paneling  to  Existing  partition for  system 
room:Providing and fixing in position 6mm MR grade ply 
and 3 mm thick ACP Panels  of  white  shade fixed with 
necessary  adhesive/silicon  sealant,  hardware  with 
finishing etc. complete, including existing door shutter as 
per  requirement  and  instructions  of  SBI-
Infra/Bank/Architect.

Sq.m 30   
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13 Providing  and  fixing  in  position  low/medium  height 
partitions made of 50 x 50 x 1 aluminium square section 
framed at 0.6m to 0.45mm c/c both ways covered with 6 
mm    ply  and  1.0  mm  laminate  (in  multi  colour)  of 
approved  shade  &  make  both  sides,  including  all 
necessary openings/cutting for cheques & other papers & 
to receive 10mm thick Float glass including all necessary 
openings  for  electric  /  telephonic  conduits  etc.  as  per 
requirement (Glass area in the partition will be deducted 
from the partition measurement).

Sq.m 25   

14 Providing and fixing 10mm thick Float glass with etching 
as per design for low ht. partitions, held with SS clits (`D' 
brackets). All exposed glass with rounded moulding and 
crystal polish. All exposed woodwork to be finished with 
03 coats of melamine polish.

Sq.m 2.5   

15 Providing & fixing  Aluminium Composite panels 4 mm 
thk.  Of exterior  grade with  50 x 25 mm size aluminium 
frame section. Filling joints with silicon sealant, cleaning, 
scaffolding etc. complete.

Sq.m 48.00   

16 Providing & supplying  Chairs having minimum following 
specifications:-
Aesthetic & ergonomically contoured backrest.  
High resilience seat foam with waterfall edge.
Personalized seating adjustments (Class 3 HPGL)
Superior PU Castors.
Synchronized mechanism with intuitive controls.
Durability, comfort & user safety.

    

a High Back (Basic Rate Rs. 5500/ Unit) No. 1   
b Medium Back (Basic Rate Rs. 4000/ Unit) No. 13   
c Visitor's Chair revolving type (Basic Rate Rs. 3000/ Unit) No. 6   

11 Providing and fixing cushion Sofa with handles out of 18 
mm thick comm. ply structure as per drawing with 100 mm 
thick high-density foam and upholstery of approved shade 
and  make  including  three  coats  of  melamine  polish  to 
T.W.  members  (wherever  exposed).  Basic  Rate  of 
Upholstery.  Rs.500.00/Sq.m.

Rmt 1.8   

Total Amount
Rupees in words : ______________________________________________________________ 

________________________
Signature & Seal of Contractor Date : _________
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